
Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 10 Foot Boat $15,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 10 Foot Boat $15,752.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 11 Foot Boat $15,500.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 11 Foot Boat $15,752.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 12 Foot Boat $16,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 12 Foot Boat $16,500.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 13 Foot Boat $16,500.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 13 Foot Boat $16,500.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 14 Foot Boat $17,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 14 Foot Boat $25,132.00 No

4. Base Model, 13 Foot Boat 

5. Base Model, 14 Foot Boat 

1. Base Model, 10 Foot Boat 
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2. Base Model, 11 Foot Boat 

3. Base Model, 12 Foot Boat 
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 15 Foot Boat $17,500.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 15 Foot Boat $25,132.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 16 Foot Boat $18,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 16 Foot Boat $26,100.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 17 Foot Boat $19,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 17 Foot Boat $33,405.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 19 Foot Boat $22,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 19 Foot Boat $37,170.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 21 Foot Boat $25,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 21 Foot Boat $44,475.00 No

8. Base Model, 17 Foot Boat 

9. Base Model, 19 Foot Boat 

10. Base Model, 21 Foot Boat 

6. Base Model, 15 Foot Boat 

7. Base Model, 16 Foot Boat 
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 22 Foot Boat $28,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 22 Foot Boat $44,475.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 23 Foot Boat $30,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 23 Foot Boat $47,245.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 24 Foot Boat $32,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 24 Foot Boat $53,390.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 25 Foot Boat $34,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 25 Foot Boat $53,390.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 26 Foot Boat $36,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 26 Foot Boat $62,490.00 No

13. Base Model, 24 Foot Boat 

14. Base Model, 25 Foot Boat 

15. Base Model, 26 Foot Boat 

11. Base Model, 22 Foot Boat 

12. Base Model, 23 Foot Boat 
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 27 Foot Boat $38,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 27 Foot Boat $62,490.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 28 Foot Boat $40,000.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories Marshall 28 Foot Boat $70,840.00 No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 30 Foot Boat $42,000.00 Yes

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 32 Foot Boat $40,000.00 Yes

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right 33 Foot Boat $42,000.00 Yes

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18. Base Model, 30 Foot Boat 

19. Base Model, 32 Foot Boat 

20. Base Model, 33 Foot Boat 

21. Base Model, 34 Foot Boat 

16. Base Model, 27 Foot Boat 

17. Base Model, 28 Foot Boat 
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28. Base Model, 44 Foot Boat 

23. Base Model, 36 Foot Boat 

24. Base Model, 37 Foot Boat 

25. Base Model, 38 Foot Boat 

26. Base Model, 40 Foot Boat 

27. Base Model, 41 Foot Boat 

22. Base Model, 35 Foot Boat 
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right Marine pricelist 2% Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories MG Xtreme Electronics & Accessories pricelist 20% No

33. Base Model, 60 Foot Boat 

34. Base Model, 65 Foot Boat 

35. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Types of Boat Motors and Accessories

29. Base Model, 46 Foot Boat 

30. Base Model, 48 Foot Boat 

31. Base Model, 52 Foot Boat 

32. Base Model, 54 Foot Boat 
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories MG Xtreme Electronics & Accessories pricelist 20% No

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Battery Systems, Inc. Exide Marine Batteries pricelist 25% Yes

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Boat Right Marine pricelist 1% Yes

42. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Types of Boat Trailers 

38. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Life Vests, Jackets, Accessories and Related Products

39. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Boat Seats, Accessories and Related Products

40. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Marine Electronics, Accessories and Related Products

41. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Marine Batteries, Chargers, Accessories and Related Products

36. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Lake, River and Waterway Equipment 

37. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Anchors, Docking Equipment, Accessories and Related Products
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. Not to exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products $150.00 Yes

Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

Boat Right Marine, Inc. State the per mile delivery fee for Boats, Trailers and Equipment. $5.00 Yes

MG Xtreme Electronics & 
Accessories State the per mile delivery fee for Boats, Trailers and Equipment. $2,500.00 No

48. Hourly Labor Rate for Installation and Repair Service of Boat, Trailers, Equipment and Products

49. Per Mile Delivery Fee for Boats, Trailers and Equipment 

43. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Options

44. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Third-Party Options (not OEM), Unpublished Options and Equipment

45. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Parts

46. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Extended Service Maintenance Agreements

47. Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Floor Plan Insurance and Lot Insurance


	% Discount

