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Suspicion

An Introduction

As I waited to meet with an immunization nurse one afternoon in January 2016, 
I sat in a quiet waiting room in an otherwise hectic Barbadian public clinic. “I’ll 
be right with you,” Nurse Dobbs yelled as she rushed past me for the third time, 
busy completing her immunization rounds. Painted on one of the clinic’s walls 
was a vibrant pink and blue mural featuring a smiling Mickey Mouse hovering 
above a bright yellow door that led to an immunization room. Framing the door 
was a dilapidated sign that read “Immunizations,” and a louvered window with 
multicolored seashell curtains flanked its left side. To the right of the door was 
what appeared to be an official, nonlocal public health poster detailing “How 
to hold a baby while breastfeeding,” along with three corresponding images of 
a white woman nursing a newborn baby. But it was the single piece of paper 
casually affixed to the top of the yellow door with tape and a red thumbtack 
that most caught my attention. On the paper was printed a low-quality pho-
tograph of a young Black boy of about three or four years old, arms crossed, 
his striped shirt worn and dirty (figures I.1 and I.2). In contrast to many global 
public health adverts that feature haunting images of emaciated African chil-
dren, in this image the boy’s cheeks are full and he is wearing an animated fa-
cial expression complete with a side-eyed look, recoiling ever so slightly from a 
laughing, well-dressed woman who appears to be a tourist. Although we have 
only a glimpse of this woman’s profile, the boy’s face is in full focus — his ma-
ture expression offering us a sense of his indivudalism that invokes not pity but  



Figure I.1 Polyclinic immunization waiting room in Warrens, Barbados, 2016. 
Photograph by the author.

Figure I.2 
“Skeptical Third 
World Kid” meme. 
Reddit, June 20, 
2012. www 
.reddit.com/r/pics 
/comments/vc0c9 
/make_this 
_skeptical_kid 
_into_a_meme 
_stat_took/. 
Screenshot by 
author.
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amusement. Text superimposed onto the image to correspond with the child’s 
skeptical expression reads, “so you mean to tell me some people turn  
down vaccinations?”

The original photograph, taken in June 2012 in Gulu, Uganda, captures a 
still-unknown African child staring warily at an American doctor by the name 
of Heena Pranav who was visiting Uganda on a medical volunteer mission. 
Posted shortly thereafter to the social media and news aggregation website Red-
dit, a user on the platform implores others to “make this skeptical kid into a 
meme, stat!”1 Thereafter referred to as “Skeptical Third World Kid” online, 
this photograph went on to become a viral sensation. Copied and captioned 
with various phrases, the image grew to become the site of popular memes that 
juxtapose supposedly irrational Western behaviors, actions, and attitudes with 
the skepticism expressed by this young Ugandan child.

Not only do such memes perpetuate the narrative of Africans in need of hu-
manitarian aid and salvation from the West, but as they proliferate behind digi-
tal screens as popular culture commodities in the West, they invite recognition, 
laughter, and perhaps pleasure in the trivial nature of “First World” problems as 
reflected in the cynical expression of this boy.

This particular meme, attached to the door of the immunization room, nota-
bly trivializes vaccine refusal. It suggests that those who might decline immuni-
zations are less informed, knowledgeable, or educated than even the young boy 
in this image, who would seemingly always accept vaccinations, without hesita-
tion, if only he were given the chance. Alongside the text that expresses the boy’s 
bewilderment over the decision to decline vaccinations, his facial expression and 
posturing insinuate a simultaneous disbelief and disappointment in this choice 
despite and amid the immense privilege that often accompanies living in places 
like the United States. Together, his incredulous stare and these trenchant words 
suggest not merely a critique of vaccination refusal but the boy’s gratitude for 
the medical care and services provided by US doctors such as Pranav, and the 
opportunities she affords to him and others in need.

Unsettled, I worried about this meme’s suggestion that those who were am-
bivalent about vaccines were ungrateful, perhaps indifferent to the medical be-
nevolence of those who make vaccines readily available in Barbados, in light of 
their shortage in places like Uganda. I wondered, Why post this image here, in 
this clinic? In placing this meme in a government-funded medical facility, was 
Barbados to be positioned in contrast to places like Uganda and places outside 
the developing world? Were Barbadians meant to smirk, to recognize them-
selves as privileged, educated people who ought to know better, be better than 
skeptical, hesitant, or resistant to vaccines? What does it actually mean to be 
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vaccine “hesitant,” as is commonly claimed by medical professionals in reference 
to people who express ambivalence toward vaccines? How does hesitancy relate 
to skepticism? What are we to make of vaccine hesitancy in postcolonial Barba-
dos? As an already suspiciously perceived Trinidadian in Barbados with whom 
many medical professionals would cautiously speak if only because of the poten-
tial for my research to assist their quest to improve vaccine compliance, I dared 
not ask these questions to the nurse I was about to interview. Suspicion wrestles 
with these thorny questions as a means of complicating the biomedical con-
ception of vaccine hesitancy and unsettling the plethora of misunderstandings, 
stereotypes, and injurious histories that undergird medical claims to hesitancy 
around the hpv vaccine in relationship to young women in Barbados — many 
of which are invoked in this meme.

hpv and Vaccine Hesitancy

hpv is a species-specific dna virus that infects epithelial cells of the human 
body, including those of the fingers, hands, mouth, anus, vagina, esophagus, and 
cervix. With more than 150 different strains, hpv is the most common sexu-
ally transmitted disease worldwide, and it is estimated that more than 80 per-
cent of sexually active women and men will encounter a sexually transmitted 
hpv infection in their lives.2 While most hpv infections are asymptomatic and 
clear without treatment, persistent infection with high-risk strains of hpv can 
develop into precancerous lesions, cervical cancer, head and neck cancers, and 
genital cancers, including cancer of the anus, vulva, penis, and vagina.3 The Ca-
ribbean is currently among the top four subregions in the world with respect to 
the incidence of cervical cancer and has the highest burden of hpv in the Amer-
icas.4 In Barbados specifically, cervical cancer is the third most common female 
cancer in women ages fifteen to forty-four years, and it is estimated that 38 new 
cervical cancer cases are diagnosed annually in a population of under 300,000.5

In light of this high incidence rate and the promise of a vaccine to target 
the human papillomavirus, Barbadians’ initially low uptake of the hpv vaccine 
came as a surprise to many local medical practitioners. Yet (hpv) vaccination 
hesitancy is not without historical and international precedent. Cultural and 
political anxieties around the safety, efficacy, and legitimacy of inoculation prac-
tices including variolation and vaccination are as old as vaccines themselves.6 
Since at least 2014, there has been a marked increase in cases of measles around 
the world, growing rates of polio outbreaks in sub-Saharan Africa and the Mid-
dle East, and a resurgence of whooping cough and mumps in the United States, 
Australia, and the United Kingdom.7 The recent development and distribution 
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of new cancer vaccines such as the hpv immunization, which protects against 
cervical and other hpv-related cancers, has presented governments with a host 
of new challenges surrounding vaccine compliance in adolescent and adult 
populations. Understanding vaccine hesitancy — a phenomenon defined by the 
World Health Organization (who) as the delay in acceptance or complete re-
fusal of vaccines — has become an urgent international public health priority.8

According to the who Strategic Advisory Group of Experts, those who are 
vaccine hesitant fall on a continuum between complete acceptance and refusal 
and should be diagnosed for the specific determinants of their hesitancy.9 In 
this framework, hesitancy is viewed as “complex and context specific, varying 
across time, place and vaccines .  .  . [and] influenced by factors such as com-
placency, convenience and confidence.”10 Here, complacency is understood by 
public health and medical professionals as a perceived lack of need for or value 
placed on vaccines. Convenience refers to one’s access to vaccines, and confidence 
speaks to the (dis)trust in vaccines or one’s provider.11 Apart from public knowl-
edge deficits in the science of vaccines, hesitancy is also understood by public 
health professionals to be closely aligned with and influenced by a range eco-
nomic, political, and sociocultural factors.12 A growing body of social science 
research on vaccine hesitancy has similarly focused on deciphering its broad-
ranging and complex determinants.13 Comparative ethnographies on vaccine 
hesitancy across the developing world, for instance, compellingly highlight the 
complex, interrelated, and multifaceted nature of factors that can affect one’s 
hesitancy, including history and politics, religion, mode of vaccine delivery, dis-
trust of the pharmaceutical industry, and the broader health system in which 
particular vaccines are introduced.14

Despite the recognition of hesitancy’s complexity across these divergent 
bodies of literature, popular science texts and news media often conflate the 
phenomenon and those who identify as vaccine hesitant with antivaccination 
views.15 Although vaccine hesitancy might entangle with antivaccine senti-
ment for some citizens in specific locations, as a phenomenon, it is not sub-
sumable to it. To suggest so overlooks hesitancy’s multiple constitutive factors, 
risks failing to address them (and thus the biomedical problem that is hesitancy 
in public health efforts to increase vaccine compliance), and, for my interests 
here, discursively misconstrues hesitancy as just a delay or refusal purportedly 
rooted in ignorance. Intervening in the bourgeoning landscape of social sci-
ence and humanities research on vaccine hesitancy research, this book wrestles 
with the term hesitancy in relationship to the hpv vaccine by looking to how 
Afro-Barbadians vernacularly reframe this scientific terminology through the 
language of suspicion.16
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Suspicion, this book asserts, is the affective intensity that Afro-Barbadians 
attach to the hpv vaccine around the lives and bodies of young Barbadian 
women, amid and alongside a range of bourgeoning bio- and information tech-
nologies in contemporary Barbados. Suspicion foregrounds Afro-Barbadians’ 
gut feelings, emotions, and colonial residues of trauma from biopolitical harms 
and engenders forms of skepticism through which they often inconceivably rea-
son to protect their children by refusing potentially life-saving technologies 
such as the hpv vaccine. In spite of the potentially fraught implications for the 
health of Barbadians, this book illustrates that suspicious affects indirectly re-
veal the complexity of the scientific logics and knowledge-making implications 
around refusal, protection, and care and promise capacious insights for the par-
ents who stay true to their embodied sensibilities and for medical practitioners, 
feminists, and transnational, (techno)science, and humanities scholars, them-
selves hesitant to produce conceptually neat end points to inescapably entan-
gled biopolitics of past and present.

The contemporary language of vaccine hesitancy and its preclusions can be 
situated in the lineage of medical discourse on noncompliance, which emerged 
in the United States in the 1950s in response to patients’ resistance or incapacity 
to abide by biomedical prescriptions. Established as both an ideology of social 
control and a popular research subject in medical literature by the 1970s, the 
term noncompliance developed from “a continuity of prior patient-categories 
such as the ‘recalcitrant’, the ‘careless’, and the ‘defaulter.’ ”17 Though the word 
functioned to bolster physicians’ sense of authority, it received repeated crit-
icism by both lay and academic audiences for its underlying assumptions of 
patient passivity, ignorance, and blind submission to the authority of medical 
providers, and by the mid-1990s it was replaced by medical professionals with 
the less authoritarian term nonadherence.18 Although the term was intended to 
foreground the role of patients as active participants in their health care deci-
sion making, medical anthropologists have reiterated how nonadherence simi-
larly places the responsibility for drug uptake and efficacy on patients, rather 
than precarious health care structures and medical systems.19

Medical anthropologist Ian Whitmarsh has traced how discourses of non-
compliance and nonadherence in Barbados have been widely adopted by doc-
tors, pharmaceutical companies, and public health and nongovernmental insti-
tutions alike to explain high levels of asthma in the country. Conflating citizens’ 
improper use of inhalers with a culture of irrationality and fearfulness in Bar-
bados, he argues, both the language and ideology of noncompliance preclude 
attention to the risk factors associated with pharmaceutical products and the 
skepticism toward the medicalization of care that inheres with Barbadians’ 
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medical decision making and pharmaceutical consumption.20 Rather than in-
dicating ignorance or fear, Whitmarsh suggests, Barbadians’ improper use or 
hoarding of unused medications might reveal citizens’ widespread frustrations 
and even critiques of the Barbadian government’s embrace of a culture of bio-
medicine focused on pharmaceuticals. In this context, Barbadians’ so-called cul-
tural failure to comply makes precarious the very category of medical compli-
ance and its construction of rationality.

Appearing most prominently in medical literature since 2011, the phrase vac-
cine hesitancy, like nonadherence and noncompliance, fails to capture the mul-
tiple affects and experiences involved in vaccination decision making, which 
often transcend the individual and the contemporary.21 Terms such as hesitancy, 
like the “Skeptical Third World Kid” meme, participate in a culture of biomed-
icine that is often frustratingly inattentive to the weight history continues to 
bear on peoples of African descent as they encounter and navigate the institu-
tion of medicine and its plethora of new biotechnologies. Elaborating Whit-
marsh’s questioning of nonadherence and noncompliance frames in Barbados 
in new ways, Suspicion unsettles the term and sedimented biomedical logics of 
hesitancy and furthermore insists on the historical significance, contemporary 
relevance, and fraught and generative nature of the presumed unsettling nature 
of Afro-Barbadians’ suspicion.

In characterizing hesitancy as unsettling, public health and medical practi-
tioners adopt the word to indicate worry and concern, not simply around the 
implications of vaccine hesitancy for the spread of diseases but around the risk 
they believe hesitancy and public distrust threatens to impose on modern dem-
ocratic societies. Much of what is unsettling about vaccine hesitancy, this book 
argues, is the extent to which it contests the hegemony of uncontested scientific 
and biomedical certainty and truth. Critical feminist, technoscience, Black, In-
digenous, queer studies, and decolonial scholars have often characterized their 
work as engaged in a politics of troubling and unsettling, referring to unsettling 
here as that which agitates, makes anew, and makes unstable such hitherto un-
contestable claims to knowing and being. Black studies and Black queer dias-
pora scholarship has consistently engaged in unsettling the nation-state, recon-
figuring its boundaries, and destabilizing Black heteropatriarchy.22 Indigenous 
feminist and decolonial theorists have explicitly deployed the term unsettling in 
different ways to disrupt the ongoing process of settler colonialism, unsettle the 
lands that have been “settled,” and critically embrace the agitation, worry, dis-
comfort, and sense of unsettlement that emerges for white settlers through this 
politic.23 Likewise, sticking and reckoning with these troublesome affects, fem-
inist technoscience scholars have variously embraced fraught and contestable 
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matters of care, piracy, and our relations to the Earth.24 Following these moves 
to unsettle, Suspicion reveals both what is unsettling and what is dismissed in the 
designation of Barbadian parents as lying hesitantly on a spectrum, in need of 
advice and reassurance to assist them in improving and sustaining vaccine con-
fidence and reaching the end goal of acceptance of hpv immunization. This 
book argues for the usefulness of suspicion for those ambivalent about vaccines 
and for critical feminist, social science, and technoscience studies scholars wish-
ing to attend simultaneously to colonial modes of scientific knowledge and con-
tentious refusals of biomedicine in the anglophone Caribbean — a region that 
is witness to increasing access to biotechnologies like vaccines and existing in 
the wake of neoliberal globalization, rapid socioeconomic and technological 
changes, and violent colonial regimes in which coercive biomedical techniques 
have long necessitated suspicion and alarm from colonized peoples.25

As Suspicion details, Barbadian parents’ biomedically prescribed irrational-
ity or hesitancy toward the hpv vaccine fails to account for these multiple and 
complex historical, transnational realities. By vernacularly reframing hesitancy 
as suspicion, I argue, Afro-Barbadians offer a thickened articulation of these 
multilayered and palimpsestic memories, realities, and contexts as affective in-
tensities that, while location-specific, hold transnational implications. Suspi-
cion emphasizes the continued salience of histories of persistent colonialism-
capitalism in the anglophone Caribbean, of which science and medicine were 
and are an integral part. Suspicion demands that we sit in proximity to these 
histories. It implores that we rethink and revise our relationality to biomedi-
cine, its inescapable entanglements in these histories of racism, pain, and dis-
comfort and in the understandings of care that these pasts continue to animate 
across space and time. In the lineage of transnational Black feminist thought 
that finds the rubric of refusal for thinking and rethinking everyday vocabu-
laries and practices of struggle against anti-Blackness to be urgent, Suspicion re-
fuses the discourse and the unsettling genealogy of hesitancy and instead em-
braces the radical possibilities of suspicion as affect.26 It thinks with and about 
suspicion and its excesses that circulate around and beyond the hpv vaccine 
in postcolonial Barbados. Moving from a discussion of suspicion’s contempo-
rary socioeconomic manifestations and historic circulations to an analysis of 
its fraught association with cultural tropes of respectability, hypersexuality, and 
protection in relation to Black women and Black female sexuality, this book 
tells a story of suspicion, its generativity and protective qualities, its impact on 
subject formation and transnational alliances, its relationship to certainty, and 
its inescapable fallibility.
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The Barbadian Landscape

The setting of this unfolding and circulating suspicion is postcolonial Barbados, 
which was under British control from 1627 to 1966, when it gained indepen-
dence.27 Barbados is the easternmost Caribbean country, stretching thirty-four 
kilometers in length and, according to locals, is just “a smile” wide. The pop-
ulace consists primarily of Black nationals, the majority of whom are descen-
dants of enslaved Africans. With a population of 286,641 as of 2018, Barbados 
is one of the most densely populated countries in the world.28 Known for its 
well-developed education system and high standard of education, the country 
has also enjoyed one of the highest literacy rates in the world.

Unlike its mountainous and volcanic neighbors, Barbados has flat and un-
dulating lands that historically contributed to the success of sugarcane as the 
most profitable crop from the colonial era through the early 1980s. After the 
mid-1980s saw a global decline in sugarcane prices and a move toward privat-
ization and liberalization, manufacturing industries were no longer profitable 
for Barbados, leading the government to begin to promote foreign investment 
in tourism and provide tax incentives to the population to encourage manufac-
turing in the postindependence era.29 Tourism and international business have 
since made up the major sectors responsible for the country’s gross domestic 
product.30

The early formation of a two-party system (the Barbados Labor Party [blp] 
and the Democratic Labour Party [dlp]) — a cabinet government modeled on 
the British Westminster system — along with a sound economy, prepared Bar-
bados for a smooth transition to independence in 1966 after more than three 
hundred years of colonization. Unlike other British Caribbean islands (such as 
Jamaica and Guyana), where the state played a dominant role in economic de-
velopment after independence, the blp and the dlp (who describe themselves 
as socially democratic) have historically supported private enterprise, public in-
frastructure, and regional integrative initiatives. Following a period of recession 
in the early 1990s accompanied by high foreign debt payments and social and 
political disequilibrium, the government established its now renowned social 
partnership in lieu of devaluing its currency and implementing structural ad-
justment policies as suggested by the International Monetary Fund.31 Although 
this blend of industry and government partnership has been foundational to the 
long-standing success of the country’s national education and health care sys-
tems, its historically competitive economy and for decades the highest-ranking 
Human Development Index (hdi) in the Caribbean, a sustained recession on 
the heels of the 2008 global financial downturn has had a grave effect on Barba-
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dos’s economic and sociopolitical conditions. For many Barbadians with whom 
I spoke between 2015 and early 2018, this recession and its ripple effects of pub-
lic sector layoffs, rising crime rates, and government instability were instrumen-
tal in breeding a deep sense of distrust toward the former government. Even 
as the country began to emerge from this recession in 2014, during my first 
research trip to Barbados from late 2015 to early 2016, I witnessed an unmistak-
able sense of apathy toward the then-dlp government, which remained widely 
characterized in public commentary by economic recession and resource scar-
city.32 Indeed, the country’s rapidly falling hdi ranking, increased unemploy-
ment, and a retreat of the state from tertiary education funding all suggest that 
the long-standing social partnership between the Barbadian state and society 
had been fundamentally upset.33

Apart from exploring suspicion around the hpv vaccine in connection 
to young Afro-Barbadian women, Suspicion is attentive to the ways affective 
communities and climates of suspicion exist alongside and in response to these 
forms of neoliberal governmentality and the changing economic climate in Bar-
bados. As I argue in chapter 1, these dynamics of economic uncertainty, state 
retreat, and a growing sense of government distrust are crucial to contextualiz-
ing Afro-Barbadians’ contemporary reception and deliberation of newly intro-
duced government initiatives, policies, and products such as the hpv vaccine, 
which emerge through an assemblage of state-biomedical and multinational 
pharmaceutical efforts to encompass a biocitizenship project.34 As I have ar-
gued elsewhere, such projects “rely on the coalescence of industry marketing, 
state recommendations, and self-governance, to facilitate the mobilization of 
certain . . . individuals” (in the Barbadian case, at first young Barbadian women 
and their parents) “to protect their at-risk, pre-damaged biologies” by choosing 
hpv vaccination.35

With a health care system at the center of the multinational pharmaceutical 
industry in the eastern English-speaking Caribbean, Barbados was one of the 
first Caribbean countries to introduce the hpv vaccine through a national pro-
gram in 2014.36 Gardasil, a quadrivalent vaccine manufactured by pharmaceu-
tical company Merck, was the first vaccine to be approved by the US Food and 
Drug Administration (fda) in June 2006 for use in girls and women ages nine 
to twenty-six to target four strains of hpv (6, 11, 16, and 18) which account for 
approximately 70 percent of cervical cancer cases and 90 percent of anogenital 
warts cases in the United States.37 Since 2006, the hpv Information Centre es-
timates that Gardasil has been licensed for use in over one hundred countries. 
Though still most widely colloquially understood to provide protection against 
the noncommunicable disease of cervical cancer in girls and women, Gardasil 
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provides protection against the aforementioned strains of the sexually transmit-
ted human papillomavirus, which can variously result in precancerous lesions; 
cervical cancer; head, neck and throat cancers; and genital cancers, including 
cancer of the anus, vulva, penis, and vagina. In turn, shortly after its introduc-
tion onto the US pharmaceutical landscape, the cdc moved to recommend the 
use of Gardasil in boys and men ages nine to twenty-six to specifically prevent 
anal cancer and anogenital warts. Following the launch of the vaccine across Eu-
ropean countries, US states, Canadian provinces, Australia, and multiple Carib-
bean countries including Barbados, governments appear to have followed this 
initial offering of the vaccine to women exclusively.38

In Barbados, the hpv vaccine was introduced through a national school-
based vaccination program in January 2014 for girls ages ten to twelve years 
old.39 Unlike the traditional introduction of new vaccines by nurses through 
the island’s public clinics (polyclinics), implementing the hpv vaccine involved 
an unusual and extensive period of public sensitization training, media broad-
casts, flyers, town hall meetings, and parent-teacher association meetings run 
by a team of specially appointed immunization nurses to inform the Barbadian 
public of the availability and necessity of the vaccine. Through this new vacci-
nation scheme, Ministry of Health immunization nurses would visit secondary 
schools to distribute parental consent forms for them to administer the vaccine 
to their daughters in subsequent school visits. Notwithstanding (in fact, possi-
bly due to) these unexpected intensive promotional and sensitization efforts, 
local immunization nurses reported acceptance rates of a mere 19 percent at the 
end of 2014.40

In addition to a perceived resistance to the vaccine from parents, nurses 
lamented that many secondary school headmasters, guidance counselors, and 
teachers were similarly suspicious about the vaccine and the new mode of de-
livery, and speculated that teachers might have conveniently failed to distribute 
consent forms to students. These suspected actions, dismal uptake rates, the rise 
in public commentary, and concern over this new vaccine quickly indicated to 
medical professionals a growing prevalence of hpv vaccine hesitancy across the 
island in 2014.

Shortly after my arrival in Barbados in September 2015, the Ministry of 
Health changed its approach to delivering the vaccine in an attempt to circum-
vent what it felt was an overwhelming resistance. This change involved expand-
ing the vaccination program to include secondary school girls under fifteen 
years of age in first, second, and third forms, and opening the vaccine to boys 
under fifteen years should their parents specially request it. To mitigate issues of 
resistance from teachers and guidance counselors, the ministry mailed consent 
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forms to parents directly, but despite even these efforts, ministry officials noted 
that vaccine uptake rates remained unfavorable. By mid-2015, the Ministry of 
Health determined that the school-based immunization approach was ill suited 
to Barbados. It withdrew the vaccination program from schools and began ad-
ministering the vaccine through the polyclinics. As of this writing, the primary 
recipients of the hpv vaccine are ten- and eleven-year-old primary school stu-
dents. In an attempt to routinize the hpv vaccine, the ministry mandated that 
immunization nurses offer the vaccine to these students alongside diphtheria, 
tetanus, and polio booster shots, which they have traditionally received at poly-
clinics in preparation to enter secondary school.

Although many of the medical practitioners I spoke with over the course of 
my research argued that this new approach significantly minimized parents’ hes-
itancy about the vaccine (as was evident, they argued, by the notable increases 
in vaccination uptake), both they and the parents I interviewed emphasized the 
continued and multiple suspicions that appeared to attach to the vaccine, the 
state, and the medicopharmaceutical assemblage behind the vaccine’s introduc-
tion. In the moments such claims were uttered, I began to wonder about the 
potential differences between vaccine hesitancy and the term suspicion.

Theorizing Suspicion

It was only after Barbadian parents, nurses, and public health professionals used 
the word suspicious rather than hesitant to describe the feelings commonly as-
sociated with the vaccine that I came to investigate the politics of suspicion 
more fully. Like the term hesitancy, suspicion encompasses a sense of cautious 
reluctance and thought. But suspicion further denotes the act of suspecting, 
of apprehending guilt or fault, of feeling wary, uncertain, and distrustful. Like 
resistance, suspicion involves a sense of doubtfulness and withholding of cer-
tainty, but suspicion, this book asserts, ought not to be simplistically conflated 
with resistance or even refusal.

As a phenomenon, the term resistance has been widely theorized and cri-
tiqued across feminist and cultural anthropological scholarship.41 The fields of 
anthropology and science and technology studies have seen a growing interest 
in theorizing the concept of refusal as a subject that is linked to but distinct from 
resistance for its productive social and political openings and ethical claims to 
the world. Embracing refusal’s multiplicity, scholars have variously invoked the 
phenomenon as a capacious concept that surrounds and moves beyond the state 
and citizenship, a method evident within and in response to politics and polit-
ical action, and a response to scientific advancements from reproductive tech-
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nologies like amniocentesis to vaccines and stem cell transplants.42 Tina Campt 
defines refusal as “the urgency of rethinking the time, space, and fundamental 
vocabulary of what constitutes politics, activism, and theory, as well as what 
it means to refuse the terms given to us to name these struggles.”43 As a Black 
feminist practice and commitment to reject the status quo that renders Black-
ness illegible, refusal simultaneously creates and names possibilities for recogni-
tion in the face of state-driven neglect and negation. Audra Simpson’s Mohawk 
Interruptus similarly invites us to consider the generativity of refusal as both 
the everyday forms of interruption and disengagement that Indigenous peoples 
use and as an anthropological mode of inquiry that “acknowledges the asym-
metrical power relations that inform the research and writing about native lives 
and politics” with an intention to honor and preserve tribal sovereignty and de-
stabilize settler nationhood.44 Building on Simpson’s concept of ethnographic 
refusal, Kim TallBear emphasizes the “histories of privilege and denial” from 
which scientific and cultural understandings of biology and belonging increas-
ingly emerge in the twenty-first century.45 For TallBear, feminist and Indigenous 
refusals of these categories might be subsequently understood as the precipice 
of change from which new forms of technoscientific developments and cul-
tural sovereignty can emerge for Indigenous peoples. Across scale and context, 
whether conceptualized as concept, subject, theory, or method, refusal must 
be recognized as significantly informed by “a complex interplay of [people’s] 
past experiences (real and imagined), present circumstances, and future hopes 
and fears.”46 In conversation with this dynamic body of scholarship around re-
fusal and Ruha Benjamin’s caution against the “analytic summersaults” in which 
technoscience continues to engage to claim medical distrust as “inexplicable 
curiosit[ies],” Suspicion works to unsettle and depathologize vaccine hesitancy 
through the Barbadian framing of suspicion.47

Like refusal, suspicion is constitutive of and co-constituted by Afro-Barbadians’ 
everyday histories, political realities, and researchers’ (ethnographic) encounters 
and experiences in Barbados. Yet suspicion is not an active form of refusal. In-
stead, following my interlocutors, this book argues for suspicion as an embodied 
affective intensity. Rather than viewing suspicion as a practice, tactic, form of 
refusal, or mode of resistance to vaccination, this book locates suspicion as af-
fective relation that circulates in the various socioeconomic, political, cultural, 
and historical formations that contextualize the vaccine, growing assemblages of 
multinational pharmaceutical networks and the state, and longer transnational 
histories of slavery, capitalist extraction, and public health. As I explore in chap-
ter 1, although suspicion is often intentional, it is simultaneously affective be-
cause to experience suspicion is to be affected by the object with which one has 
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contact. Building on and intervening in theories of affect and embodied episte-
mology situated in women of color and transnational feminisms, Suspicion ex-
plores the messy entanglements of health care work, biomedical authority, state 
priorities, and noninnocent histories of colonial medical injustice in Barbados 
to offer suspicion as a unique theoretical contribution to existing scholarship 
on affect and broader discussions in the Caribbean and beyond on the afterlives 
of slavery.

Since about 2000, scholars have increasingly begun to theorize affect accord-
ing to a range of feminist, philosophical, and theoretical orientations.48 Across 
these traditions, affect is variously theorized as sensational embodiments, mo-
tivations, and intensities that constitute relations and create social orders. The 
concept of affective economies, as usefully offered by Sara Ahmed, highlights 
how affects work by attaching themselves to bodies and spaces, mediating the 
relationship between them. These and other feminist theorizations of affect as 
capacities to feel that are sticky, contagious, physiological, and psychological 
importantly capture the ways emotions can shape us in unpredictable ways and 
diagnose material and social conditions.49 In conceptualizing hesitancy as suspi-
cion and suspicion as affect, it is insightful to conceive this emotional intensity 
as that which is sticky and contagious, circulating in affective economies that 
multiply and accumulate in value over time and space amid social, psychic, and 
material realms.50

Long before the so-called turn to affect, critical feminist theorists in the 
1980s gestured to emotional intensities and embodied feelings of love, empa-
thy, and care as crucial modes of knowledge to make sense of and resist oppres-
sive social formations.51 At the same time, Audre Lorde’s and other queer, rad-
ical, and women of color deployments of eroticism, and what Gloria Anzaldúa 
and Cherríe Moraga refer to as “theor[ies] in the flesh,” were foundational in 
introducing an understanding of affect and affective intensities as the modes 
through which women of color navigate survival and liberation.52 These affec-
tive turns, Claudia Garcia-Rojas forcefully argues, are what destabilize much 
of the contemporary “White affects and White forms of knowledge” that have 
come to characterize the recognizable canon of affect theory today and that 
overwhelmingly disavow women of color feminisms.53 Though not often la-
beled under affect studies, women of color feminist theory has long and fun-
damentally captured the affective intensities at stake for people of color and 
Third World women, enabling them to survive, more than survive, negotiate, 
and refuse the racialized and hegemonic systems that inhabit their lives. Suspi-
cion extends this lineage of women of color and Black feminist scholarship that 
disrupts “White affect” studies, gesturing to the languages of the self through 
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which Afro-Barbadians theorize their felt ambivalences and their enmeshment 
in matrices of (post)colonial violence, power, pain, and care.54

Along with these women of color feminist insights and political commit-
ments to a language and politics of the self that are grounded in, on, and of the 
flesh, critical work in transnational feminist studies offers generative points of 
departure for exploring the submerged and entangled affective roots and pro-
cesses in the Caribbean.55 Specifically, transnational feminist theory provides a 
basis for understanding how affects such as suspicion are multiply layered, cir-
culating across and between borders over time and bound up in and responsive 
to the sedimentation of conquest and colonialism.

Transnational feminist M. Jacqui Alexander analogizes the idea of the pa-
limpsest to that of a parchment: “[One] that has been inscribed two or three 
times, the previous text having been imperfectly erased and remaining therefore 
still partly visible . . . The idea of the ‘new’ structured through the ‘old’ scram-
bled, palimpsestic character of time, both jettisons the truncated distance of 
linear time and dislodges the impulse for incommensurability, which the ideol-
ogy of distance creates.”56 Arguing for a conception of modernity and matter as 
complexly layered, Alexander calls on us to rescramble our understandings of 
the “here and now,” making the notion of time a question of itself.57 To believe 
otherwise absolves new impetuses and iterations of history of their unsettling 
effects and falls prey to that “historical amnesia” Stuart Hall cautions against.58 
Suspicion mobilizes this analogy of the palimpsest as a metaphor to frame suspi-
cion and identify how it shifts and intensifies through various itineraries across 
space, continuously attaching and reattaching itself to ideologies of science, ra-
tionality, nationalism, and capitalism in and across longer historical and polit-
ical contexts of public health, race, and nationalism in Barbados and the an-
glophone Caribbean. Contributing to a body of transnational Black feminist 
scholarship attuned to the afterlives of slavery; the movement and mobilization 
of power, relationality, and affect across space and time; and the exacerbated 
inequalities produced by neoliberalism in the anglophone Caribbean and be-
yond, this book offers suspicion as both theory and praxis — as generative and 
fraught, sticky and contagious because it is palimpsestic, living and lasting in the 
body, in embodied memories and histories of Afro-Barbadians in ways that are 
difficult to let go. Moreover, this book argues, suspicion interrogates the bio-
medical offerings of care presented via the hpv vaccine. In so doing, I show, sus-
picion reveals care’s inequalities and political stakes — by mapping how health 
care work, biomedical authority, state priorities, assemblages, and noninnocent 
histories of colonial medical injustice often unwittingly intertwine. Fraught as 
it is, this book highlights that suspicion ought to be not only something to be 
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overcome but understood for its gestures toward less injurious forms of health 
care promotion.

Suspicion’s empirical contributions further intervene across the interdisci-
plinary fields of science and technology studies, medical anthropology, and crit-
ical race studies, detailing Afro-Barbadians’ responses to a critical public health 
campaign designated to ameliorate the high rates of cervical cancer. Indeed, de-
spite the powerful advances vaccines promise to afford in places like Barbados 
and the wider Caribbean, Suspicion shows that many Afro-Barbadians’ enthu-
siasm about the vaccine is hampered because of multifaceted concerns about 
widely theorized discourses and prescriptions of Black female sexuality in the 
Caribbean, the motivations of the pharmaceutical industry and its assemblages 
working to promote the vaccine, and the influx of new globalized technolo-
gies present in contemporary Barbados (of which the vaccine is one). Likewise, 
and as excerpts from Barbadian nurses and parents highlight, affects of suspi-
cion hold the potential to shape citizens’ engagements with technologies like 
the vaccine but also with biomedical, pharmaceutical, and governmental claims 
to certainty and knowledge about hesitancy, care, and protection. As suspicion 
attaches to the capitalist interests behind the pharmaceutical promotion of the 
vaccine and to tropes of hypersexuality and erotic subjugation under slavery, the 
term hesitancy’s “historical” tropes are revealed and situated in longer histories 
of racialized science, dispossession, and exploitation, all of which characterized 
the colonial period.

Undermining the three cs of hesitancy (complacency, confidence, and con-
venience), suspicion, as articulated by Afro-Barbadian parents with whom I 
spoke, further highlights the tenuous and problematic nature not merely of 
hesitancy but of the hpv vaccine and its discursive, financial, and scientific log-
ics. Positioned alongside predominant biomedical claims that vaccine hesitancy 
is an unsettling threat to public health, the integrity of vaccines, and modern 
democratic societies, an understanding of suspicion as a palimpsestic affect ex-
poses and contests the legacies within which such claims lie. These are claims 
that in the Caribbean and much of the colonized world echo colonial imper-
atives to civilize and “save” physically and morally threatening Black colonial 
subjects through the logics of science. From eugenicist “scientific” beliefs of 
Afro-Caribbean people as uncivilized, lazy, barbarous, and responsible for the 
spread of tropical diseases and weakening of empire, to medical and legal forms 
of regulation implemented in response to colonial anxieties around the Black 
female body as a form of racial and sexual poison, often injurious and racialized 
forms of science and biomedicine were central to the project of colonialism.59 
Rather than emerging in resistance to vaccination, suspicion travels in time to 
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intimately connect to these racialized histories and reaches forward to attach to 
devices like the hpv vaccine, to what many of the parents with whom I spoke 
deemed contemporarily ideologically proximate techniques and technologies 
of control. In complex ways and with variable implications for citizens’ health, 
suspicion speaks back to and interrupts the claims to settled knowledge that 
biomedicine espouses through advocating for the vaccine as the means to care 
and protection. By situating suspicion toward this (bio)medical technology in 
Barbados in longer spatiotemporal, cultural, and political genealogies that an-
imate contemporary suspicions toward state-led public health interventions, 
Suspicion challenges mainstream narratives of irrationality that undergird the 
discourses of hesitancy.

Methodological Frames

During my time in Barbados, I was witness to much speculation around the 
reasons for parents’ hesitancy toward the hpv vaccine: from public health pro-
fessionals’ theories about parents’ ignorance, miseducation, or distrust in sci-
ence to the widespread lay and medical belief that it was a pervasive “cultural” 
concern around respectability, premature adolescent (female) sexuality, and the 
vaccine’s relationship to sex that dissuaded many parents from accepting the 
vaccine for their teenage daughters. Rather than trying to determine the under-
lying factors behind Afro-Barbadians’ concerns about the hpv vaccine, my re-
search initially began with an interest in understanding how parents expressed 
their ambivalence to it and the effects of this “hesitancy” in Barbadian society. 
Working from the hypothesis that the phenomenon of vaccine hesitancy could 
be understood beyond nervous indecision, I wanted to know what was at stake, 
not only for Barbadian parents who were ambivalent about the hpv vaccine but 
for the adolescents to whom the vaccine was targeted and for the medical pro-
fessionals who were onerously working to deliver the vaccine to the Barbadian 
public. How did they conceptualize and attempt to counter this hesitancy? 
How did adolescents view their parents’ concerns? Were they aware of public 
commentary and perceptions about their bodies and their sexuality? How did 
medical professionals promote the hpv vaccine and counter vaccine hesitancy, 
and what public feelings did these actions engender? While this line of inquiry 
opened me to many of the histories that made up parents’ hesitancy, it uniquely 
emphasized the affective nature of what I came to understand as suspicion, rather 
than hesitancy — less an active form of resistance toward something and more 
an embodied, affective, and felt response that circulates around the vaccine, its 
promotion, its purported risk management of adolescent female sexuality, and 
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its complex entanglement in global biopolitical and state assemblages, past and 
present.

Though my fieldwork in Barbados began in 2015 by exploring these ques-
tions, I quickly came to investigate Afro-Barbadian parents’ affective refusals 
and suspicions of the hpv vaccine. Over the course of eleven months between 
2015 and 2018, my methodological approach to interviewing Barbadians about 
their experiences of suspicion was guided by a genealogically informed transna-
tional feminist inquiry that attends to the local by tracing multiple lines of en-
gagement elsewhere and at other times.60 As a historical and relationally based 
feminist theory and analytic, transnational feminism foregrounds questions of 
race, conquest, sexuality, colonialism, and global capitalism while engaging with 
the theorizations of women of color feminists to generate understandings and 
critiques of social and cultural processes and their global imbrications across 
place, space, and time.61 Throughout this book, I draw on transnational femi-
nism as theory and methodology to map how suspicion is genealogically shaped 
and transformed by material, social, political, and economic forces internal and 
external to the Barbadian nation. Building on Alexander’s aforementioned gen-
erative invocation of the palimpsest as an analogy for our complexly layered 
temporalities, I foreground the role of affective relations and formations such 
as suspicion amid the nonlinear movement of state technologies, techniques, 
global capital, and biopolitics in Barbados and the anglophone Caribbean.

In the tradition of transnational feminist work in and on the Caribbean, 
which has emphasized bringing into ideological proximity diverse geographical 
places and “historical” processes of colonialism with “modern” social formations 
and claims of nation-building, I not only ask why people experienced suspicion 
toward and around this vaccine but genealogically trace how suspicion emerges 
across time and place for differently situated Barbadians and in relationship to 
transnational contexts.62

My genealogical approach to this work began with reading secondary his-
torical texts and accounts of colonial medicine, biopolitics, and reproductive 
health care in Barbados and the anglophone Caribbean. These histories, along 
with transnational feminist theorizations of the body politic, biopolitics, and 
temporality, were integral to my capturing of the entangled, cyclical histories 
and repertoires of suspicion toward biomedicine, public health, and discourses 
of risk in the history of the Caribbean.63 I combined this historical analysis with 
in-depth interviews and informal discussions with parents, adolescents, and 
medical practitioners. Between 2015 and 2018, I conducted sixty in-depth in-
terviews with middle-class, primarily Afro-Caribbean Barbadian adolescents, 
medical practitioners, and parents — most of whom had previously accepted all 
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other childhood immunizations for their children but responded to my call, 
which specifically sought to interview parents who were ambivalent or hesi-
tant about the hpv vaccine.64 My recursive investigation also included media 
analysis of the vaccine’s promotion and reception, which entailed analyzing 
Barbadians’ commentary on the vaccine and its marketing via Facebook posts, 
newspaper editorials, and online discussion threads, and a discursive analysis of 
public health social media campaigns, flyers, memes, and print and online phar-
maceutical advertising for the vaccine. Everyday conversation with Bajan friends 
and family members, participants at conferences at the University of the West 
Indies, and locals in weekend markets and cafés, as well as listening to radio talk 
shows and segments on the local TV station Caribbean Broadcasting Corpora-
tion and reading the prominent Nation News newspaper were also informative 
in this regard.65

Recruiting parents and teenagers was a painstaking and challenging task I  
came to attribute in part to the suspicion that attached toward me as a foreigner —  
specifically Trinidadian — researcher. Many of the parents I interviewed ques-
tioned why I was not doing this research in Trinidad, and others frequently 
assumed I was working on behalf of a pharmaceutical industry or medical es-
tablishment sent to persuade or coerce them into accepting the hpv vaccine 
because of my interest in their “hesitancy,” my foreign status, and, as some noted, 
my affiliation with an international university.66 Parents’ suspicions toward me 
as a foreigner often meant they would not agree to talk to me unless they met 
me in person or I had been given the “all clear” by a friend or acquaintance I 
had previously interviewed. As such, I relied heavily on word of mouth, snow-
ball sampling, and sharing my flyers on social media (primarily through Face-
book) to connect with participants after having less success with posting flyers 
in public places like malls, local cafés, and coffee shops. This nonrandom sam-
pling method, my use of social media, and the characteristics of the local ven-
ues where I posted my flyers meant I had less control over the subjects whom 
I interviewed. As a result, the distribution of parents and teenagers whom I 
had the opportunity to interview was confined to self-described, middle-class 
Afro-Barbadians.

Although there were evident variations in participants’ levels of income and 
positionalities vis-à-vis the state, their overarching middle-class status meant 
that we met in their well-kept homes or local cafés, and more often than not, 
they drove their cars to meet me on the island’s busy south coast. All of these 
parents, with the exception of two who were homemakers, held middle-upper-
class jobs such as teachers, authors, office managers, sales representatives, hair 
stylists, business owners, consultants, and engineers. Throughout the book, I 
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detail the various ways class was invoked by Afro-Barbadian parents and teen-
agers in relation to suspicion. As were most Barbadians, the middle-class Afro-
Barbadians I interviewed were offered the vaccine through the government’s na-
tional vaccination program rather than through their doctors’ clinics. As I detail 
within the book, although the hpv vaccine was available through select private 
doctors’ offices, its prohibitive cost meant that only a few local physicians of-
fered it privately. As such, and despite the limitations of the representativeness 
of my sample, the medical professionals and immunization nurses with whom 
I spoke confirmed the widespread prevalence of Barbadians’ vaccine hesitancy 
across the island’s demographics when the vaccine was initially introduced in 
2014, as evidenced by low uptake rates, and their experiences speaking with par-
ents at town hall and parent-teacher meetings.67

The medical professionals I interviewed included senior medical officers at 
the Ministry of Health, private pediatricians, general practitioners, gynecolo-
gists, and immunization nurses in the island’s nine publicly funded polyclin-
ics responsible for distributing the hpv vaccine through the national vaccine 
program. As the primary distributors of the vaccine to Barbadians across the 
socioeconomic spectrum, immunization nurses provided a unique and broad 
characterization of “vaccine-hesitant” Barbadian parents and their beliefs about 
their concerns, often across class.68 Many of the health professionals I spoke with 
congratulated me on my research, noting the importance of its eventual findings 
for improving vaccine uptake. In retrospect, it appears that the reasons medical 
professionals appreciated my research and willingly participated in it are the 
same reasons many of the parents I interviewed were suspicious of it. Like doc-
tors, many parents incorrectly assumed that the motivations behind my research 
were to increase vaccine compliance and were skeptical of me and my research 
on this account. Throughout this book, I engage with excerpts of my discus-
sions with these doctors and nurses to provide their viewpoints on parents’ sus-
picion and its underpinnings to better portray the medicopolitical landscape in 
Barbados and emphasize the differences in affective stances among differently 
constituted Barbadians.

The Chapters

The chapters that follow think with and about suspicion and its excesses around 
and beyond the hpv vaccine in Barbados. Moving from a discussion of sus-
picion’s contemporary socioeconomic manifestations and historic circulation 
to an analysis of its fraught association with cultural tropes of respectability, 
hypersexuality, and protection, I tell the story of suspicion, its generativity, and 
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its fallibility; its impact on subject formation and transnational alliances; its re-
lationship to certainty; and its inescapable shortcomings.

Chapter 1, “Circles of Suspicion,” introduces the book and provides an over-
view of how I came to follow suspicion as an affect that attached not only to the 
hpv vaccine but to non-Barbadian Caribbean citizens like myself and a range 
of biopolitical and economic policies, practices, and technologies introduced 
or supported by the Barbadian government. This chapter situates the socioeco-
nomic environment into which the vaccine was introduced in Barbados to un-
derscore the intensity with which suspicion is distributed spatially and suffused 
across the Barbadian state’s seemingly banal political and economic maneu-
vers. By discussing the current culture of neoliberal globalization in Barbados 
through the country’s membership in the Caribbean Community and Com-
mon Market, I trace the actualization of suspicion as it moves toward arrange-
ments like this, its facilitation of intraregional migration, and related govern-
ment policies and engagements that sought to promote economic growth and 
securitization in Barbados in the years immediately surrounding the 2014 in-
troduction of the hpv vaccine. Detailing nurses’ and parents’ articulations of 
suspicion around the hpv vaccine, I highlight how suspicion similarly attaches 
to this biomedical technology in ways that are enmeshed in the economy but 
productive of relations and divides that transcend the economic realm.

Chapter 2, “Risk and Suspicion,” explores how affects of suspicion have tran-
sitioned and intensified across time in Barbados and the anglophone Caribbean. 
Specifically, it situates suspicion around the hpv vaccine and its administration 
in Barbados in the long, racialized history of transatlantic slavery, its enmeshment 
in risk and capitalism, and its infrastructures of biopolitical surveillance. Tracing 
a particular set of instances within which risks to coloniality and postcoloniality 
have been managed through surveillance across time in Barbados and the Brit-
ish Caribbean from the 1780s to the present, this chapter highlights the impera-
tive to study Black women as risk(y) and the role of biopolitics/biomedicine  
in mitigating these risks. Suspicion, this chapter shows, exists in a symbiotic re-
lationship with the surveillance of risk and racialized biopolitics, attaching both 
to those holding these perceived risks and to the colonial officials and (post)
colonial states attempting to mitigate these risks through racialized biopoliti-
cal techniques of care, control, and surveillance. In turn, this chapter illustrates 
how affects of suspicion materially and metaphorically recall colonial residues, 
prompting Afro-Barbadian parents to more closely interrogate pharmaceutical  
technologies like the vaccine and question the state’s agenda in promoting them.

Chapter 3, “(Hyper)Sexuality, Respectability, and the Language of Suspi-
cion,” traces the contradictory articulations and theorizations of suspicion by 
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adolescents, nurses, and parents as they relate to respectability politics, sex, and 
bio- and communication technologies in Barbados. Guided by adolescents’ re-
flective commentary on the multiple silences and suspicions that surround their 
sexual bodies and technologies like the hpv vaccine, I begin by exploring how 
suspicion around the vaccine is understood by differently situated Barbadian 
citizens. In contrast to teenagers’ and nurses’ frequent claims that parents’ sus-
picion toward the vaccine was indicative of a long-standing “cultural” concern 
about female hypersexuality and Afro-Caribbean peoples’ subsequent adop-
tion of a politics of respectability, Afro-Caribbean parents offered a more nu-
anced understanding of the ways respectability inheres in their concerns about 
state-led biomedical technologies. Reading parents’ in-depth discussions of 
their suspicion in connection with feminist theorizations of respectability, I 
highlight how residues of suspicion reflect a complex navigation of hegemonic 
colonial stereotypes of Black female hypersexuality and a distrust of the post-
colonial state and index a growing wariness of proliferating neoliberal global 
circuits of technoscience, ethics, economics, and pharmaceutical exchange of 
which this vaccine is a part. In the wake of a series of school sex scandals across 
the Caribbean from 2011 to 2016 in which cellphones were used to record teen-
agers’ sexual activity, I broaden the discussion around suspicion to further re-
view the language of suspicion as it attaches to communication technologies 
like smartphones and laptops and the adolescents who use them. Like the hpv 
vaccine, I argue, these technologies surface affects of suspicion, distrust, and 
anxiety for many Afro-Barbadian parents in relation to adolescent sex, often in 
unexpected ways.

In chapter 4, “Care, Embodiment, and Sensed Protection,” I detail the mul-
tiple constitutions of sense and protection that the Barbadian doctors, nurses, 
and parents I interviewed variously forged around the hpv vaccine. Here I am 
especially interested in how Afro-Caribbean parents embody suspicion and 
frame these suspicions and subsequent refusals of the vaccine as ethical impera
tives. Tracing the ethical encounters and narratives of protection these parents 
described to me, I argue that suspicion signals for these parents the limits of 
protection, reproduction, and futurity — categories that are especially complex 
in the “afterlife of slavery.”69 As something more than unsettling and problem-
atic, suspicious affects and the modes of protection they engender are protective 
forms of self-determination and defense for Afro-Caribbean parents grappling 
with the sordid histories of those objects and policies to which suspicion at-
taches, histories that continue to inhabit the contemporary moment. These un-
derstandings of protection, I show, exist in opposition to the view of protection 
articulated by Barbadian medical professionals and the state in its biocitizenship 
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struggle to introduce technologies like the hpv vaccine in the name of protec-
tion — importantly speaking back to injurious histories of care, yet holding po-
tentially troubling implications for the health of Afro-Barbadian communities.

Chapter 5, “Suspicion and Certainty,” pulls these lines of inquiry together 
to think more broadly about suspicion, its effect on subjectivity, and its exis-
tence amid the precarious projections of certainty espoused by the biomedical 
community. Although the doctors and nurses I interviewed were quick to attri-
bute hpv vaccine hesitancy to antivaccination rhetoric online and the general 
ease with which unreliable medical information could be accessed, this chapter 
shows how suspicion continually exceeds even these boundaries, diffusing into 
the medical profession itself and existing alongside medical professionals’ claims 
to certainty and truth around the hpv vaccine. Rather than viewing suspicion 
and certainty in an opposition, this chapter argues for a relational understand-
ing of the two and illustrates the generative insights they offer public health 
practitioners and academics seeking to understand the racialized, gendered, his-
torical, and affective politics of care and its presumed impediments. Situating 
parents’ ideologies of suspicion, protection, and claims to self-determination 
in the context of Caribbean feminist and Afro-diasporic activism and advo-
cacy around racialized communities’ health from the 1970s to 1990s, the chapter 
ends with a consideration of the transformative potential certainty and suspi-
cion collectively promise for improved public health promotion of hpv and its 
related diseases in Barbados.
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