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From here I will go to Bonn and then Berlin, where there stands a grim symbol of power untamed. 
The Berlin Wall, that dreadful gray gash across the city, is in its third decade. It is the fitting 
signature of the regime that built it. . . . 
 
We’re approaching the end of a bloody century plagued by a terrible political invention—
totalitarianism. Optimism comes less easily today, not because democracy is less vigorous, but 
because democracy’s enemies have refined their instruments of repression. Yet optimism is in order, 
because day by day democracy is proving itself to be a not-at-all-fragile flower. From Stettin on the 
Baltic to Varna on the Black Sea, the regimes planted by totalitarianism have had more than 30 years 
to establish their legitimacy. But none—not one regime—has yet been able to risk free elections. 
Regimes planted by bayonets do not take root. . . . 
 
We have not inherited an easy world. If developments like the Industrial Revolution, which began 
here in England, and the gifts of science and technology have made life much easier for us, they 
have also made it more dangerous. There are threats now to our freedom, indeed to our very 
existence, that other generations could never even have imagined. 
 
There is first the threat of global war. No President, no Congress, no Prime Minister, no Parliament 
can spend a day entirely free of this threat. And I don't have to tell you that in today’s world the 
existence of nuclear weapons could mean, if not the extinction of mankind, then surely the end of 
civilization as we know it. That’s why negotiations on intermediate-range nuclear forces now 
underway in Europe and the START talks—Strategic Arms Reduction Talks—which will begin later 
this month, are not just critical to American or Western policy; they are critical to mankind. Our 
commitment to early success in these negotiations is firm and unshakable, and our purpose is clear: 
reducing the risk of war by reducing the means of waging war on both sides. 
 
At the same time there is a threat posed to human freedom by the enormous power of the modern 
state. History teaches the dangers of government that overreaches—political control taking 
precedence over free economic growth, secret police, mindless bureaucracy, all combining to stifle 
individual excellence and personal freedom. . . . 
 
Historians looking back at our time will note the consistent restraint and peaceful intentions of the 
West. They will note that it was the democracies who refused to use the threat of their nuclear 
monopoly in the forties and early fifties for territorial or imperial gain. Had that nuclear monopoly 
been in the hands of the Communist world, the map of Europe—indeed, the world—would look 
very different today. And certainly they will note it was not the democracies that invaded 
Afghanistan or suppressed Polish Solidarity or used chemical and toxin warfare in Afghanistan and 
Southeast Asia. 
 
If history teaches anything it teaches self-delusion in the face of unpleasant facts is folly. We see 
around us today the marks of our terrible dilemma—predictions of doomsday, antinuclear 
demonstrations, an arms race in which the West must, for its own protection, be an unwilling 
participant. At the same time we see totalitarian forces in the world who seek subversion and 



conflict around the globe to further their barbarous assault on the human spirit. What, then, is our 
course? Must civilization perish in a hail of fiery atoms? Must freedom wither in a quiet, deadening 
accommodation with totalitarian evil? 
 
Sir Winston Churchill refused to accept the inevitability of war or even that it was imminent. He 
said, “I do not believe that Soviet Russia desires war. What they desire is the fruits of war and the 
indefinite expansion of their power and doctrines. But what we have to consider here today while 
time remains is the permanent prevention of war and the establishment of conditions of freedom 
and democracy as rapidly as possible in all countries.” 
 
Well, this is precisely our mission today: to preserve freedom as well as peace. It may not be easy to 
see; but I believe we live now at a turning point. 
 
In an ironic sense Karl Marx was right. We are witnessing today a great revolutionary crisis, a crisis 
where the demands of the economic order are conflicting directly with those of the political order. 
But the crisis is happening not in the free, non-Marxist West, but in the home of Marxist-Leninism, 
the Soviet Union. It is the Soviet Union that runs against the tide of history by denying human 
freedom and human dignity to its citizens. It also is in deep economic difficulty. The rate of growth 
in the national product has been steadily declining since the fifties and is less than half of what it was 
then. . . . 
 
The constant shrinkage of economic growth combined with the growth of military production is 
putting a heavy strain on the Soviet people. What we see here is a political structure that no longer 
corresponds to its economic base, a society where productive forces are hampered by political ones. 
 
The decay of the Soviet experiment should come as no surprise to us. Wherever the comparisons 
have been made between free and closed societies—West Germany and East Germany, Austria and 
Czechoslovakia, Malaysia and Vietnam—it is the democratic countries that are prosperous and 
responsive to the needs of their people. And one of the simple but overwhelming facts of our time 
is this: Of all the millions of refugees we’ve seen in the modern world, their flight is always away 
from, not toward the Communist world. Today on the NATO line, our military forces face east to 
prevent a possible invasion. On the other side of the line, the Soviet forces also face east to prevent 
their people from leaving. . . . 
 
No, democracy is not a fragile flower. Still it needs cultivating. If the rest of this century is to witness 
the gradual growth of freedom and democratic ideals, we must take actions to assist the campaign 
for democracy. . . . 
 
We cannot ignore the fact that even without our encouragement there has been and will continue to 
be repeated explosions against repression and dictatorships. The Soviet Union itself is not immune 
to this reality. Any system is inherently unstable that has no peaceful means to legitimize its leaders. 
In such cases, the very repressiveness of the state ultimately drives people to resist it, if necessary, by 
force. 
 
While we must be cautious about forcing the pace of change, we must not hesitate to declare our 
ultimate objectives and to take concrete actions to move toward them. We must be staunch in our 
conviction that freedom is not the sole prerogative of a lucky few, but the inalienable and universal 



right of all human beings. So states the United Nations Universal Declaration of Human Rights, 
which, among other things, guarantees free elections. 
 
The objective I propose is quite simple to state: to foster the infrastructure of democracy, the system 
of a free press, unions, political parties, universities, which allows a people to choose their own way 
to develop their own culture, to reconcile their own differences through peaceful means. 
 
This is not cultural imperialism, it is providing the means for genuine self-determination and 
protection for diversity. . . . 
 
What I am describing now is a plan and a hope for the long term—the march of freedom and 
democracy which will leave Marxism-Leninism on the ash heap of history as it has left other 
tyrannies which stifle the freedom and muzzle the self-expression of the people. And that's why we 
must continue our efforts to strengthen NATO even as we move forward with our Zero-Option 
initiative in the negotiations on intermediate-range forces and our proposal for a one-third reduction 
in strategic ballistic missile warheads. 
 
Our military strength is a prerequisite to peace, but let it be clear we maintain this strength in the 
hope it will never be used, for the ultimate determinant in the struggle that’s now going on in the 
world will not be bombs and rockets, but a test of wills and ideas, a trial of spiritual resolve, the 
values we hold, the beliefs we cherish, the ideals to which we are dedicated. . . . 
 
Well, the task I've set forth will long outlive our own generation. But together, we too have come 
through the worst. Let us now begin a major effort to secure the best—a crusade for freedom that 
will engage the faith and fortitude of the next generation. For the sake of peace and justice, let us 
move toward a world in which all people are at last free to determine their own destiny. 


